HOUSE DOCKET, NO. 1614 FILED ON: 1/15/2025

HOUSE ............... No.

The Commontwealth of Massachusetts

PRESENTED BY:

Meghan K. Kilcoyne

To the Honorable Senate and House of Representatives of the Commonwealth of Massachusetts in General
Court assembled:

The undersigned legislators and/or citizens respectfully petition for the adoption of the accompanying bill:

An Act relative to judicial compensation.

PETITION OF:
NAME: DISTRICT/ADDRESS: DATE ADDED:
Meghan K. Kilcoyne 12th Worcester 1/15/2025

1ofl



10

11

12

HOUSE DOCKET, NO. 1614 FILED ON: 1/15/2025

HOUSE ............... No.

[Pin Slip]

The Commontwealth of Massachusetts

In the One Hundred and Ninety-Fourth General Court
(2025-2026)

An Act relative to judicial compensation.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives in General Court assembled, and by the authority
of the same, as follows:

SECTION 1. Section 22 of chapter 211 of the General Laws is hereby amended by

striking the figure “$232,101” and inserting in place thereof the figure “$267,101”.

SECTION 2. Said Section 22 of chapter 211 is hereby further amended by striking the

figure $226,187 and inserting in place thereof the figure “$261,187”.

SECTION 3. Section 2 of chapter 211A of the General Laws, is hereby further amended

by striking the figure “$219,856” and inserting in place thereof the figure “$254,856.

SECTION 4. Said section 2 is hereby further amended by striking the figure “$213,966”

and inserting in place thereof the figure “$248,966”.

SECTION 5. Section 4 of Chapter 211B of the General Laws is hereby further amended

by striking the figure: “$207,855 and inserting in place thereof the figure “$242,855”.

SECTION 6. Said Section 4 is hereby further amended by striking the figure “$213,966

and inserting in place there of the figure “$248,966”.

1of2



13 SECTION 7. Said section 4 is hereby further amended by striking the figure 220,160 and

14  inserting in place thereof the figure $255, 160.

15 SECTION 8. The provisions of the act shall take effect on July 1, 2025.

20f2



